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Self-Paced Online Training Gives You Flexibility

EASYPOWER TRAINING

EasyPower’s Self-Paced Online Training program o�ers online courses that give you the opportunity 
to learn EasyPower or XGSLab at your convenience. The courses are designed to be a “hands-on” 
learning experience with the analysis software. To provides you with the necessary tools for immedi-
ate bene�ts for your own power system analysis and designs, we o�er the following courses, which 
can be taken separately as well as an EasyPower bundle package.

EasyPower Essentials 1: Hands-On Online Course

Course Contents

EasyPower Essentials 2: Protective Device Coordination Online Course

Course Contents

This complete 3-part bundle is eligible for 1.5 CEUs from IEEE (Institute of Electrical and Electronics 
Engineers) and costs is $1,250 – a savings of over $400 over purchasing the courses individually.

Info and registration: easypower.thinki�c.com/collections

EasyPower Essentials Bundle: Hands-On, Protective Device 
Coordination and Arc Flash Risk Assessment Online Courses

The class covers the following: EasyPower overview and features, one-line development, MCCs and 
panel schedules, application of ShortCircuit™, PowerFlow™ overview, sample cases and applications. 
This class covers content presented during the �rst two days of our regional training seminar - Easy-
Power Hands-On.  Earn 0.5 CEUs – Cost is $500.

The class covers the following: Overview of PowerProtector™ for protective device coordination 
studies, proper system coordination and increased reliability, time-current curves.  Covering Easy-
Power's Protective Device Coordination feature, the training demonstrates how to use time current 
curves (TCCs) and reports for protective device coordination studies, proper system coordination and 
increased system reliability. Earn 0.2 CEUs – Cost is $350.

Info and registration: easypower.thinki�c.com/courses/easypower-hands-on

Info and registration: easypower.thinki�c.com/courses/protective-device-coordination

Self-Paced
Online Training

25 Videos 27 Quizzes 6 Texts 3 PDFs 3 Downloads 8.0 hrs

PDFTx

12 Videos 12 Quizzes 6 Texts 1 PDFs 3 Downloads 4.0 hrs

PDFTx
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Self-Paced Online Training Details

EasyPower Essentials 3: Arc Flash Risk Assessment Online Course

Course Contents

The class covers the following: Overview of NFPA 70E and IEEE-1584, PPE requirements, arc �ash 
studies, hands-on EasyPower ArcFlash, and more.  Earn 0.8 CEUs – Cost is $800.

Info and registration: easypower.thinki�c.com/courses/arc-�ash

XGSLab and Grounding Analysis Course 

Course Contents

This class covers the following: grounding system components, permissible voltage limits per IEEE 
Std 80, soil model development, fault current split, and more grounding analysis concepts to provide 
personnel and public safety at power systems. This course shows how to use the XGSLab® software to 
design and evaluate your grounding systems. Earn 0.2 CEUs – Cost is $350.

You have up to 45 days after your enrollment to complete the course. If you purchased a bundle, you 
are allowed up to 90 days to complete the courses in the bundle.

Note: If you are purchasing the course for someone else to use, please sign up with their name and 
contact information so that they receive the appropriate communications about their enrollment and 
receive CEU certi�cations in their name.

Reminder: Signi�cant discounts apply for users on Premium Maintenance
Let us know if you would like more information on the many bene�ts of Premium Maintenance.

Info and registration: easypower.thinki�c.com/courses/XGSLabGroundingAnalysis

XGSLAB TRAINING

32 Videos 30 Quizzes 1 Texts 2 PDFs 3 Downloads 8.0 hrs

PDFTx

17 Videos 16 Quizzes 4.5 hrs


